

Quincy Public School District #172 Asbestos Abatement - Quincy Baldwin School Engineer's Project No. 13-0258		Schemel-Tarrillion, Inc.	Great Western Abatement, Inc.	Thornburgh Abatement, Inc.	M & O Environmental Company	Triple A Asbestos Services, Inc.	Midwest Service Group	Intentionally Left Blank
ITEM	ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
1. BASE BID 1 - ASBESTOS ABATEMENT DEMOLITION PORTION	\$ 270,000.00	\$196,775.00	No Bid	\$238,930.00	\$329,500.00	\$179,935.00	\$217,355.00	
2. BASE BID 1 PROJECT CONTINGENCY ALLOWANCE	\$ 15,000.00	\$15,000.00	No Bid	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	
3. TOTAL BASE BID 1	\$ 285,000.00	\$211,775.00	No Bid	\$253,930.00	\$344,500.00	\$194,935.00	\$232,355.00	
4. BASE BID 2 - ASBESTOS ABATEMENT RENOVATION PORTION	\$ 140,000.00	\$153,690.00	\$103,450.00	\$122,120.00	\$183,000.00	No Bid	\$161,250.00	
5. BASE BID 2 PROJECT CONTINGENCY ALLOWANCE	\$ 5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	No Bid	\$5,000.00	
6. TOTAL BASE BID 2	\$ 145,000.00	\$158,690.00	\$108,450.00	\$127,120.00	\$188,000.00	No Bid	\$166,250.00	
7. CAN BIDDER PERFORM BOTH BASE BIDS		YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/>
8. BASE BID 1 AND 2 COMBINED	\$ 389,500.00	\$370,900.00	N/A	\$359,050.00	\$506,000.00	N/A	\$378,605.00	
9. BASE BID 1 AND 2 COMBINED PROJECT CONTINGENCY ALLOWANCE	\$ 20,000.00	\$20,000.00	N/A	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	N/A	\$20,000.00	
10. TOTAL COMBINED BASE BID 1 AND 2	\$ 409,500.00	\$390,900.00	N/A	\$379,050.00	\$526,000.00	N/A	\$398,605.00	
11. BID SECURITY		X	X	X	X	X	X	
12. NO. OF ADDENDA	1	1	1	1	1	1	1	

The above is a tabulation of bids received by the Quincy Public School District #172 on March 15, 2018 at the Board of Education Office, 1416 Maine Street, Quincy, IL 62301



Micah Holtschlag

**KLINGNER & ASSOCIATES, P. C.**  
Engineers • Architects • Surveyors

616 North 24<sup>th</sup> Street, Quincy, IL      Ph 217.223.3670 – Fax 217.223.3603  
 3338 Market Street, Hannibal, MO      Ph 573.221.0020 – Fax 573.221.0012  
 610 N. 4<sup>th</sup> Street, Suite 100, Burlington, IA      Ph 319.752.3603 – Fax 319.752.3605  
 49 North Prairie Street, Galesburg, IL      Ph 309.342.4042 – Fax 309.341.3781  
www.klingner.com