

16-4038

Clark County R-1 School District
Indian Pride Learning Center

	Architect/Engineer Estimate	Bleigh Construction Co.	Martin General Contractors LLC	Myers Construction Inc.	PSR Construction Inc.	Whiston Construction Co. Inc.		
BASE BID	\$3,756,500.00	\$3,674,000.00	\$4,129,000.00	\$3,914,821.00	\$3,745,000.00	\$3,570,000.00		
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE # 1	\$180,000.00	\$154,000.00	\$152,000.00	\$168,195.00	\$127,000.00	\$210,000.00		
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE # 2	\$8,378.00	\$22,300.00	\$3,000.00	\$22,357.00	\$22,000.00	\$23,500.00		
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE # 3	\$24,941.00	\$49,800.00	\$57,000.00	\$67,540.00	\$49,000.00	\$52,500.00		
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE # 4	\$10,824.00	\$17,500.00	\$11,000.00	\$8,250.00	\$14,100.00	\$15,400.00		
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE # 5	\$5,678.00	\$6,900.00	\$13,000.00	\$11,612.00	\$6,000.00	\$12,200.00		
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE # 6	\$30,000.00	\$35,400.00	\$40,000.00	\$105,531.00	\$97,000.00	\$100,000.00		
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE # 7	\$8,033.00	\$14,200.00	\$17,000.00	\$15,400.00	\$14,500.00	\$16,000.00		
DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE # 8	No Estimate	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
BID SECURITY		X	X	X	X	X		
PROJECT CONTINGENCY ALLOWANCE	\$75,000.00	X	X	X	X	X		
(ADDITIVE - NOT IN BASE BID)								
ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM #1		X	X	X	X	X		
ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM #2		X	X	X	X	X		
ACKNOWLEDGE TOTAL COMPLETION		X	X	X	X	X		



I certify the above is a tabulation of bids received by

Clark County R-1 School District at 4:00 PM on Thursday November30, 2017

in the Board Room at Central Office, 427 W. Chestnut, Kahoka, MO 63445

K. Mulch 11-30-2017

KLINGNER
& ASSOCIATES, P. C.
Engineers • Architects • Surveyors